
HEAT 1
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

1 2 Noels Touch 3.58 slaw Rnon 400 Y
2 4 Trip Ralph 3.46 Ldl Finwell 1100 Y
3 6 Caling Marge 3.45 Qaway Rnon No Bid

RESULT: 4,6,2 Distances5,1 Time 29.34

HEAT 2
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

5 Cavies Emerald 3.46 Qaway Rnon N/S
7 Hard Shaw 3.53 Evaw  Rnon 650 Y
4 Victory Chase(w) 3.5 EP stydwell 1500 Y

RESULT: 6,4,2 Distances4,7 TIME: 29.39

HEAT 3
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

8 2 Jam Tart 13:26 Evaw Ranon 400 Y
9 4 Denises Star 3.42 Faway Ald 400 Y

10 6 Galley Sailor 3.53 Evaw Bmp1 No Bid
RESULT: 4,2.6 Distances4,8 TIME: 29.37

HEAT 4
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

11 2 Gold Finch 3.52 EP Ld2 1000 N
12 4 Victory Shaw 3.42 Faway Ald 500 Y
13 6 Ferndale :Larry 3.53 Evaw Blk3 600 Y

RESULT: 4,2,6 Distancesnk,2 TIME: 29.69

HEAT 5
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

14 2 Cavies Bid 3.52 Evaw Blkrnup 500 Y
15 4 Roseville Rage 3.46 Faway Styd 4000 N
16 6 Flint 3.57 Ld2 Evch 500 N

RESULT: 4,6,2 Distances2,3 TIME: 29.34

HEAT 6
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

17 2 Lisnakil Burt 3.69 slaw Rnon 50 Y
18 4 Geneva Joanie 3.55 Evaw Bmp 150 Y
20 6 Titania 3.46 Ep Ald 800 400 N

RESULT: 6,4,2 Distances5,6 TIME: 29.58

HEAT 7
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

21 2 Roberts Deseray 3.62 Slaw  Rnon No Bid
23 4 Roseville Flash 3.36 Faway  Evch 800 Y 
22 6 Strand Lark(w) 3.49 Chlbs Styd 600 Y

RESULT: 6,4,2 Dist 2,3 TIME: 29.59
HEAT 8
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N



24 2 Lisnakill  Rhys 3.74 Slaw nvshwd 50 Y
25 4 Flip Flops 3.54 Qaway A2nd 250 Y
26 6 Kinglscourt Lad 3.51 EP Ald 500 N

RESULT: 6,4,2 Dist 5,5 TIME: 29.66

Lot TP Greyhounds Name Split Remarks RES BID SOLD Y/N
27 2 Tallhasse 3.59 Evaw Ldbs No Bid
29 4 Astro Boy 3.56 Blk3 Styd 350 N
28 6 Dower Marie (w) 3.49 Qaway Rnon No Bid

RESULT: 2,6,4 Dist 3,4 TIME: 29.62
HEAT 10
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

30 2 Newmarket Ace 3.54 Evaw Finwell 2600 Y
31 4 Roseville Tiny 3.55 Evaw Rnon 700 N
32 6 Lisnakill Lar 3.62 Evaw Bmp 100 Y

RESULT: 2,4,6 Dist 2,1 TIME: 29.96

HEAT 11
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

33 2 Compass Mary 3.45 Qaway Ald 300 N
34 4 Aherla Gift 3.5 Evaw Rnon 100 Y
35 6 Butcher Bounty 3.61 Slaw Rnon 200 Y

RESULT: 2,4,6 Dist 4,3 TIME: 29.44

HEAT 12
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

36 2 Citizen  Super 3.49 Evaw Fd 200 Y
38 4 Coolykereen  Dip 3.48 Styd Chlrpin 2150 Y
40 6 Honey Rise 3.42 EP Aldon 1,200 N

RESULT: 6,4.2 Dist 0.05,9 TIME: 28.99
HEAT 13
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

41 2 Compass Caoimhe 3.46 Chl3  Stydon N'/S
42 4 Fornaught Dave 3.41 Faway Wl 500 Y
44 6 kilcrea Gift 3.58 Slaw Nvrshwd Y

RESULT: 2,4,6 Dist 2,6 TIME: 29.66
HEAT 14
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

46 2 Bookies Bill Qaway Fd 200 Y
48 4 Honey Flash Ldbs Stydon 1000 Y
49 6 Compass Bridget Slaw Nvrshwd NO/BID

RESULT: 4,2,6 Dist 4,5 TIME: 29.3
HEAT 15
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

50 2 Cavies Biffo 3.52 Ld2 Hldon 400 Y
51 4 Fornaught Joe 3.5 Evaw Bmp1 600 Y



53 6 Tyrap Dancer 3.52 Bmp1 Chlraon 200 Y
RESULT: 2,6,4 Dist 1,1 TIME: 29.64
HEAT 16
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

54 2 Egmont Twink 3.49 Evaw Fd 100 N
56 4 Black Cyrus 3.54 Mid,P 600 Y
57 6 Compass Zara 3.51 Evaw Stydon 400 N

RESULT: 4,6,2 Dist 2,8 TIME: 29.28

HEAT 17
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

58 2 Lower Stand 3.59 Evaw Blk N/S N
59 4 Lanod Jess 3.55 Evaw Rnon N/S N
60 6 Blue Agenda 3.52 Evaw Stydon 900 Y

RESULT: Dist 8,3 TIME: 29.57

HEAT 18
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

61 2 Cooly Gorm 3.7 Slaw Blk 600 N
62 4 Tober Lotty 3.53 Faway Ald 800 Y
63 6 Maffra Julie 3.6 Evaw Fd NO/BID

RESULT: 4,2,6 Dist 6,3 TIME: 29.45
HEAT 19
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

64 2 Ballyfinn Bomber 3.42 Dspld Evch NO/BID
65 4 Samba Joie 3.43 Evaw Fd N/S
66 6 Kehers Princess 3.36 FawayDspld Y

RESULT: 2,6,4 Dist nk,2 TIME: 29.88
HEAT 20
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

67 Cutting Grass Ld2 Hldon 800 Y
69 Tober Caff Qaway Bmp1 500 Y
73 Seafield Brack Evaw Chldrnon 100 N

RESULT: 2,6,4 Dist 0.5,0.5 TIME: 29.54
HEAT 21
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

74 2 Knockrour Bamma 3.42 Faway,Blk 300 Y
75 4 Silly Question 3.47 Blk1 Ldnrline 500 Y
76 6 Corrin Blue 3.57 Ldbs Bmp NO/BID

RESULT: 4,6,2 Dist 0.5,3 TIME: 29.84
HEAT 22
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

77 2 Calling Maeve 3.4 Faway Ald N/S
80 4 Lauragh Lee 3.52 Evaw ranon N/S
79 6 Tober Jeff (W) 3.5 Evaw W 550 N

RESULT: 2,6,4 Dist 3,3 Time: 29.17



HEAT 23
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

81 2 High Glen 3.52 Evaw stdyon 500 N
83 4 Kilgrogan Sam 3.45 Qaway fdrunin 550 Y
82 6 Starcash Sandy(W) 3.64 Ld3 styd 900 Y

RESULT: 6,2,4 Dist 1,4 TIME: 29.37

HEAT 24
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

85 2 Carraig Penny 3.45 Qaway Impd4 300 N
86 4 Liss Cool 3.56 Evaw SUS N/S
84 6 Corrin Lizzy(W) 3.5 Evaw Styd 200 Y

RESULT: 6,2,4 Dist 10,Nk TIME: 29.5
HEAT 25
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

88 2 Dunnes Milk 3.61 Slaw,ranon 800 700 N
89 4 High Baby 3.4 Faway Ald 500 N
90 6 Starcash Thomas 3.55 Evaw Fd NO/BID

Results: 4,2,6 Dist 2,7 Time 29.05
Heat 26
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

92 2 Golden Wonder 3.57 Evaw Blk1 N/S
93 4 Glandart Lemon 3.59 Blk1 Ranon N/S
94 6 Balintore Who(W) 3.62 Blk1 Styd 300 N

RESULTS: 6,4,2 Dist 10,2 Time 29.56
Heat 27
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

95 2 Glenbowen Mae 3.48 Ba,Blk1 N/S
99 4 Catsrock Calipso 3.39 Faway Blk1 500 N
97 6 Rockys First(W) 3.6 Ld2 Stydwell 800 Y

RESULT: 6,4,2 Dist 6,12 TIME: 29.1
HEAT 28
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

101 2 Speed on who 3.43 Qaway Hdnrline NO/BID
102 4 Antos Lad 3.58 Styd Ldnrline 600 Y
103 6 Transtown Miller 3.44 Qaway Blk2 NO/BID

RESULT: 4,2,6 Dist 0.5,7 TIME: 29.54
Heat 29
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

104 2 Maffra Penske 3.54 Evaw Ranon 250 Y
105 4 Imokilly Rumble 3.51 Qaway Fd NO/BID
107 6 Lisnakill Julian 3.57 Ld3 Styd 500 Y

RESULT: 6,2,4 Dist 6,1 TIME: 29.56
Heat 30
Lot TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N



109 2 Ballychane Tutu 3.48 Faway bmp1 NO/BID
110 4 Siennas Star 3.6 Ldbs Styd 2000 Y
112 6 Cavies Flash 3.67 Slaw Stydon 600 Y

RESULT: 4,6,2 Dist 2,5 Time: 29.12
Heat 31
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

78 2 Bookies Crash 6 Faway Ald 150 Y
98 4 Lisnakill Jimbob 6.23 Slaw stydon 350 Y

RESULT: 2,4 Dist 4 Time: 32.19
Heat 32
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

43 2 Tyrap Black Ld2 styd NO/BID
47 4 Sheedy Queen Evaw blk1 50 Y
96 6 Transtown Bud Faway ranon 100 Y

RESULT: 2,6,4 Dist 3,2 Time: 18.43
Heat 33
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

55 2 Sheedy Drive On Slaw ranon N/S
68 4 Beanos Last Bet Qaway blk1 NO/BID

111 6 Transtown Divi Faway Ald NO/BID
RESULT: 6,4,2 Dist 1,6 Time: 18.47




